
Ajai CK <systems@lead.ac.in>

BSNL Leased Circuit BIll_2025-26
JAO TR-3 <jaotr3pkd@gmail.com> 19 February 2025 at 11:10
To: info@lead.ac.in, Ajai CK <systems@lead.ac.in>

Sir,

Total payable for 2 quarters will be Rs 165200/-

On Wed, Feb 19, 2025 at 11:08 AM JAO TR-3 <jaotr3pkd@gmail.com> wrote:
Your request for rate revision has been received and it is requested to pay 82600/- (70000 + GST) for the said period. a
suitable credit note will be issued soon.

On Wed, Feb 19, 2025 at 11:05 AM JAO TR-3 <jaotr3pkd@gmail.com> wrote:
Sir,

Please see the leased circuit bill for April - June 2025-26. Kindly clear the dues on or before 28.02.2025

--
With Thanks & Regards

JAO TR-III
O/o GMT Palakkad BA
BSNL, T B Road, Palakkad-678014
Mob: 9496657295

--
With Thanks & Regards

JAO TR-III
O/o GMT Palakkad BA
BSNL, T B Road, Palakkad-678014
Mob: 9496657295

--
With Thanks & Regards

JAO TR-III
O/o GMT Palakkad BA
BSNL, T B Road, Palakkad-678014
Mob: 9496657295
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